From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

Re:

Robert Biden rhbdc@icloud.com 6
July 16, 2018 at 10:59 AM

Ha Biden halliebiden@gmail.com

lu hate this its killing me. Call me.
Robert Hunter
rhbdc@me.com

On Jul 15, 2018, at 8:30 PM, Hallie Biden <halliebiden@gmail.com> wrote:

| just saw this sorry. Are you ok? Can | call you?

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 15, 2018, at 9:27 PM, Robert Hunter <rhbdc@icloud.com> wrote:
Will you please allow Natalie to call me.

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 15, 2018, at 5:05 AM, Hallie Biden <halliebiden@gmail.com> wrote:

| see you have not gotten a day of sobriety yet. Thanks for your passive aggressive
asshole email and not answering the question. | assume the answer is no you are not
coming to DE for Michele’s funeral.

Sent from my iPhone
On Jul 15, 2018, at 7:29 AM, Robert Hunter <rhbdc@icloud.com> wrote:

| adore your children Hallie | will never leave them. | will always be there for them and I'm
sorry you you feel rejected by me. But you do realize | don’t care about anything but the
kids. You will get better and you have a chance of being at least a mother that doesn’t
purposely harm there children. Just keep with it and lean on people that understand how
to love. You'll stop doing you and maybe you will do for someone else. You will wake up
one day and realize that you can actually think of an act of love that you can do for
someone besides yourself. And | hope you have someone to turn to in bed in my
brothers’ house and that that act of love can be for him or her or them and not a secret
someone. That will be a special day in your life and | hope that you remember me with a
smile. And say | wish | could call him and tell him | finally get what they meant. And
don’t feel as if you lost the two best men you or anyone could have ever even dreamed
of. You got just what you wanted for a time and all is not lost. My family will never
disrespect you around the children or in public. Have a great time at the beach with all
of your friends who love you so much- Devon is a special person

Sent from my iPhone
On Jul 15, 2018, at 12:50 AM, Hallie Biden <halliebiden@gmail.com> wrote:

And i hope you realize that you were calling me incessantly and then you block me as
if | was the one calling you. Unblock it for the rare occasion that | may need to reach
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Sent from my iPhone



From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

Katie Dodge dodgekatie13@gmail.com
Fwd: 6/12 Hunt transferred $2,000
September 27, 2018 at 10:09 AM
Hunter Biden rhbdc®@icloud.com

See below. It accounts for the $3k she referenced. Plus she will need the additional
$1460

$1360

For new college visits.

Grand total of $5900 roughly.
-- Katie

Begin forwarded message:

From: Kathleen Biden <kathleenbiden@mac.com>
Date: September 27, 2018 at 11:41:27 AM EDT
To: Katie Dodge <Dodgekatie13@gmail.com>
Subject: 6/12 Hunt transferred $2,000

Hunter's last transfer to me, via ApplePay, for girls was 6/12. Hunt transferred $2,000.

Below are money transfers and purchases for girls. Finnegan’s were mostly for her apartment.
| didn’t give any money to Naomi - | pay for her gym as a gift and her workouts but | don’t lend
her money. I’'m actually hoping she will take a loan and take responsibility for her cost of living.
| do spend money/lend to Finn and Maisy.

You may know that | do not receive child support. Hunter agreed to pay 100% of girls’ costs
through graduate school. | am committed to him paying the full cost.

Not sure if Hunt is asking for itemized. Below is expenses. Most are transfers to girls. Total is
$3,108, plus cost of visiting schools.

Let me know if you need anything else.
Thanks Katie.
Naomi:

Finnegan:
$100

$250

$454 flight
$200

$200 grocery
$113 Amazon
$137 IKEA
$158 Amazon
$64 Amazon

Maisy:
$150



$250 Amtrak
$52

$100

$30

$300

$100

Sent from my iPhone



From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

Robert Hunter rhbdc@icloud.com &
Re: 6/12 Hunt transferred $2,000 '
September 30, 2018 at 7:32 PM

Katie Dodge dodgekatie13@gmail.com

Kathleen does not receive child support because she choose not to although offered because
it is an advantage to her and a detriment to me with regards to taxes and it would have made
an already outrageously generous settlements offer look insanely generous but likely un-
supportable by me. And she is making not paying and has not paid literally a dime for even
food for Maisy which | cover for maisy through Uber eats and Grubb- hub which she and
Kathleen seem to use almost every other day. And for this and about 10,000.000 other reasons
like the audi and car registration with

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 27, 2018, at 10:09 AM, Katie Dodge <dodgekatie13@gmail.com> wrote:

See below. It accounts for the $3k she referenced. Plus she will need the additional
$1460

$1360

For new college visits.

Grand total of $5900 roughly.
-- Katie

Begin forwarded message:

From: Kathleen Biden <kathleenbiden@mac.com>
Date: September 27, 2018 at 11:41:27 AM EDT
To: Katie Dodge <Dodgekatie13@gmail.com>
Subject: 6/12 Hunt transferred $2,000

Hunter's last transfer to me, via ApplePay, for girls was 6/12. Hunt transferred $2,000.

Below are money transfers and purchases for girls. Finnegan’s were mostly for her
apartment. | didn't give any money to Naomi - | pay for her gym as a gift and her workouts
but | don’t lend her money. I'm actually hoping she will take a loan and take responsibility for
her cost of living. | do spend money/lend to Finn and Maisy.

You may know that | do not receive child support. Hunter agreed to pay 100% of girls’ costs
through graduate school. | am committed to him paying the full cost.

Not sure if Hunt is asking for itemized. Below is expenses. Most are transfers to girls. Total
is $3,108, plus cost of visiting schools.

Let me know if you need anything else.
Thanks Katie.
Naomi:

Finnegan:
$100

U



$454 tlight
$200

$200 grocery
$113 Amazon
$137 IKEA
$158 Amazon
$64 Amazon

Maisy:

$150

$150

$250 Amtrak
$52

$100

$30

$300

$100

Sent from my iPhone






From: Angela Wise angela.wise13@gmail.com [
Subject: Account
Date: June 19, 2017 at 3:44 PM
To: Robinson Hunter droidhunter88 @gmail.com

Also just so you are aware, no other transfer or wire came through. It is absolutely fine because
| need guidance on the first project, | am simply making you aware because you said you
ordered one......

Sent from my iPhone



From: Kathleen Biden kathleenbiden@mac.com @™
Subject: Bill for Naomi
Date: November 5, 2015 at 3:55 AM
To: Joan Mayer jmayer@rosemontseneca.com, Robert Biden rhbdc@icloud.com

Morning Joan! Below is a picture of a bill Naomi received at school. It's from a time when she
had an x-ray done and didn't give her insurance card. Do you think you could look into it?
Thanks sweet Joan!
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Downloading...

Sent from my iPhone



From: Joan Mayer jmayer@rosemontseneca.com P
Subject: Re: Bill for Naomi
Date: November 5, 2015 at 4:35 AM
To: Kathleen Biden kathleenbiden@mac.com
Cc: Robert Biden rhbdc@icloud.com

Will do! I'll call and say this is still pending with insurance and hopefully they'll lay off for a bit. |
think we can still resubmit this to insurance since it hasn't been a year yet.

On Thursday, November 5, 2015, Kathleen Biden <kathleenbiden@mac.com> wrote:
Morning Joan! Below is a picture of a bill Naomi received at school. It's from a time when
she had an x-ray done and didn't give her insurance card. Do you think you could look into
it? Thanks sweet Joan!

Joan K. Mayer

Rosemont Seneca Advisors, LLC

1010 Wisconsin Avenue NW, Suite 705
Washington, DC 20007

0: 202-333-1880

m:202-841-8543
jmayer@rosemontseneca.com




From: Kathleen Biden kathleenbiden@mac.com
Subject: Re: Bill for Naomi
Date: November 5, 2015 at 4:37 AM
To: Joan Mayer jmayer@rosemontseneca.com
Cc: Hunter Biden rhb@rspdc.com

Thanks Joan! You're a superstar. ev
Sent from my iPhone

On 05 Nov 2015, at 7:35 am, Joan Mayer <jmayer@rosemontseneca.com> wrote:

Will do! I'll call and say this is still pending with insurance and hopefully they'll lay off for a bit.
| think we can still resubmit this to insurance since it hasn't been a year yet.

On Thursday, November 5, 2015, Kathleen Biden <kathleenbiden@mac.com> wrote:
Morning Joan! Below is a picture of a bill Naomi received at school. It's from a time when
she had an x-ray done and didn't give her insurance card. Do you think you could look
into it? Thanks sweet Joan!

Joan K. Mayer

Rosemont Seneca Advisors, LLC

1010 Wisconsin Avenue NW, Suite 705
Washington, DC 20007

0: 202-333-1880

m:202-841-8543
jmayer@rosemontseneca.com




From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

Hunter Biden hbiden@rosemontseneca.com &
Re: Conf call on Sunday 12/4, 4:00 p - L
December 5, 2016 at 7:12 AM '
Valerie Biden Owens hurricane5155@gmail.com

Im sorry | didn’t make call. Partially logistics but mainly heat. | know that | lend credence to the
idea that I'm not available not there not aware of whats going Ono begin to not me offended in
any way buy the person | love the most bc you and Mom made me he of course came after the
only person in the world who truly is blood of blood bone of my bone _ no one will ever share
that bond you are one in the same and will be together forever.” Ithat was the one thing | heard
and | knew he did too it a=was always ours and ours alone no matter how much we fought and
punched and screamed and said the most horrible things to each other the truth is the
frustration always lay in the fav=ct that it would never stick not even for a minute not eb-ven for
the time it took to realix=zed the next you were about to say was sure vanity or hubris or for
show or whatever it was uypu kew it woudnet be

anyd\gJhlesaspaid and i paid like |

dad co-signed each loan then which was only 7500K per semester which we both took in
loans in our names whaight tutition which ything but a blank a rubber dagger or the one |
always dreaded the most...a lesson to be taught (in public usually in from t of a boarding
school crowd). You know he only invited me once to Lilly’s when | was a third year at Yale and
had already secured a jon=Db that would pay all his tuition ( both college and law school- he
only had something like 56K left because e we both worked through college from freshman
year and Dad never paid one dime for room boarding books summer classes just str

m sure you and Mom both said it in some way slightly different but all my fathers words but
really have tthat | am unreliable and inconsistent.
On Dec 3, 2016, at 6:08 PM, Valerie Owens <hurricane5155@gmail.com> wrote:

Valerie Biden Owens
Begin forwarded message:

From: "Chung, Kathy S. EOP/OVP" <kathy_s_chung@ovp.eop.gov>

Date: December 2, 2016 at 7:21:17 PM EST

To: "Ricchetti, Steven J. EOP/OVP" <steven_|_ricchetti@ovp.eop.gov>, "Hunter Biden"
<hbiden@rosemontseneca.com>, Valerie Biden Owens <hurricane5155@gmail.com>, Ted
Kaufman <tedkaufman@comcast.net>, Mel Monzack <mmonzack@monlaw.com>

Cc: 'Bernal, Anthony R. EOP/OVP" <Anthony_R._Bernal@ovp.eop.gov>, "Ruffner, Richard
B. EOP/OVP" <Richard_B_Ruffner@ovp.eop.gov>, "lbarra, Marcos A. EOP/OVP"
<Marcos_A_lbarra@ovp.eop.gov>, ‘Lance, Ginna L. EOP/OVP"
<virginia_|_lance@ovp.eop.gov>, "Goepfert, Stephen EOP/OVP"




<stephen_goeptert@ovp.eop.gov>
Subject: Re: Conf call on Sunday 12/4, 4:00 pm

Participant Dial-In: (202) 395-6392<tel:(202)%20395-6392;6481055>
Participant Code: 6481055<tel:(202)%20395-6392;6481055>

Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 2, 2016, at 12:05 PM, Chung, Kathy S. EOP/OVP
<kathy_s chung@ovp.eop.gov<mailto:kathy_s_chung@ovp.eop.gov>> wrote:

| will send Conf call info shortly. Pls let me know ASAP if you CANNOT participate. Thank
you.

Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 2, 2016, at 9:08 AM, Chung, Kathy S. EOP/OVP
<kathy_s chung@ovp.eop.gov<mailto:kathy_s_chung@ovp.eop.gov>> wrote:

We are confirmed for conference call on Sunday 12/4 at 4:00 pm. If you have any
questions, pls let me know. Thanks you

Sent from my iPhone






From: Katie Dodge dodgekatie13@gmail.com @
Subject: Dental & Vision
Date: March 15, 2019 at 7:31 AM
To: Linda Shapero Ishapero@globaldeez.com
Cc: Hunter Biden rhbdc@icloud.com

Hi LInda - attached is the bills for March and April for dental and vision coverage for Hunter &
the girls and Erin, the other employee. Thank you. - Katie

el
=
PDF
3_256524_2019
0305172857.pdf



From: Linda Shapero Ishapero@globaldeez.com
Subject: RE: Dental & Vision
Date: March 15,2019 at 7:37 AM
To: Katie Dodge dodgekatie13@gmail.com
Cc: Hunter Biden rhbdc@icloud.com

Will pay.

Thanks!

From: Katie Dodge <dodgekatie13@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, March 15, 2019 10:31 AM

To: Linda Shapero <Ishapero@globaldeez.com>
Cc: Hunter Biden <rhbdc@icloud.com>
Subject: Dental & Vision

Hi Linda - attached is the bills for March and April for dental and vision coverage for
Hunter & the girls and Erin, the other employee. Thank you. - Katie



From: Katie Dodge dodgekatie13@gmail.com
Subject: Re: Dental & Vision
Date: March 15, 2019 at 7:42 AM
To: Linda Shapero Ishapero@globaldeez.com
Cc: Hunter Biden rhbdc@icloud.com

Thank you! - Also | received a paper copy of the March DC Health Links. Itis due 3/31. Do
you want that as well?

On Mar 15, 2019, at 10:37 AM, Linda Shapero <Ishapero@globaldeez.com> wrote:

Will pay.

Thanks!

From: Katie Dodge <dodgekatie13 @gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, March 15, 2019 10:31 AM

To: Linda Shapero <Ishapero@globaldeez.com>
Cc: Hunter Biden <rhbdc@icloud.com>
Subject: Dental & Vision

Hi Linda - attached is the bills for March and April for dental and vision coverage for
Hunter & the girls and Erin, the other employee. Thank you. - Katie




From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

Cc:

Linda Shapero Ishapero@globaldeez.com
RE: Dental & Vision

March 15, 2019 at 7:42 AM

Katie Dodge dodgekatie13@gmail.com
Hunter Biden rhbdc@icloud.com

Yes please

From: Katie Dodge <dodgekatie13@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, March 15, 2019 10:42 AM

To: Linda Shapero <Ishapero@globaldeez.com>
Cc: Hunter Biden <rhbdc@icloud.com>
Subject: Re: Dental & Vision

Thank you! - Also | received a paper copy of the March DC Health Links. It is due 3/31.
Do you want that as well?

On Mar 15, 2019, at 10:37 AM, Linda Shapero <Ishapero@globaldeez.com>
wrote:

Will pay.

Thanks!

From: Katie Dodge <dodgekatie13 @gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, March 15, 2019 10:31 AM

To: Linda Shapero <Ishapero@globaldeez.com>
Cc: Hunter Biden <rhbdc@icloud.com>
Subject: Dental & Vision

Hi Linda - attached is the bills for March and April for dental and vision
coverage for Hunter & the girls and Erin, the other employee. Thank you. -
Katie



From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

Cc:

Katie Dodge dodgekatie13@gmail.com
Re: Dental & Vision

March 15, 2019 at 12:10 PM

Linda Shapero Ishapero@globaldeez.com
Hunter Biden rhbdc@icloud.com

The paper bill | received is the bill you just paid. So we are good on DC links until 4/30/19.
Hurray! Thank you. Have a nice weekend.

-- Katie

On Mar 15, 2019, at 10:42 AM, Linda Shapero <|shapero@globaldeez.com> wrote:

Yes please

From: Katie Dodge <dodgekatie13@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, March 15, 2019 10:42 AM

To: Linda Shapero <Ishapero@globaldeez.com>
Cc: Hunter Biden <rhbdc@icloud.com>
Subject: Re: Dental & Vision

Thank you! - Also | received a paper copy of the March DC Health Links. It is due 3/31.
Do you want that as well?

On Mar 15, 2019, at 10:37 AM, Linda Shapero <Ishapero@globaldeez.com>
wrote:

Will pay.

Thanks!

From: Katie Dodge <dodgekatie13 @gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, March 15, 2019 10:31 AM

To: Linda Shapero <Ishapero@globaldeez.com>
Cc: Hunter Biden <rhbdc@icloud.com>
Subject: Dental & Vision

Hi Linda - attached is the bills for March and April for dental and vision
coverage for Hunter & the girls and Erin, the other employee. Thank you. -
Katie



From: Kathleen Biden kathleenbiden@mac.com
Subject: Refinancing
Date: December 11,2018 at 7:18 AM
To: rhbdc@icloud.com

I’'m talking to the bank today about getting an extension on my rate. Is the tax lien something
you'll be able to take care of in the near future or do | need to cancel the refinancing?

Sent from my iPhone



From: Robert Hunter rhbdc@icloud.com &
Subject: Wire
Date: October 3, 2018 at 2:51 PM '
To: cynthia.duncan@wellsfargoadvisors.com

Please wire Kathleen Biden $6000 from the business brokerage account today if possible
thank you Cindy. Hunter

Sent from my iPhone



